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Member
Turner

0n018-032

AN ORDINANCE TO AUTHORIZE AND APPROVE A CONTRACT
BETWEEN THE CITY OF WII,MINGTON AND RIGGINS, INC. F'OR

AND D

WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 2-308 and Section 8-200 of the City Charter, the

City of Wilmington is authorized to enter into contracts for the supply of personal property or

the rendering of services for a pericid of more than one year if approved by City Council by

ordinance; and

WHEREAS, the City publicly advertised the specifications for Contract 19017PW -

GaSoline/Heating OiliDiesel Fuel (the "Contract") - in accordance with the requirements of

Section 8-200 of the City Charler, and subsequently awarded the Contract, a copy of which,

in substantial form, is attached hereto and incorporated by reference herein as Exhibit "A", to

Riggins, Inc. (the "Contractor"), the highest ranked proposer; and

WHEREAS, the term of the Contract is for a period of one (l) year from July l,

2018 through June 30, 2019, at an estimated price of One Million One Hundred Sixty-Nine

Thousand Six Hundred Sixty Dollars ($1,169,660.00), with the possibility of'two (2)

extensions of one (1) year thereafter at the same annual price, at the option of the City,

subject to budget appropriations; and

WHEREAS, the primary purpose of the Contract is to provide gasoline, heating oil,

and diesel fuel to the City's Department of Public Works; and

WHEREAS, said extension periods were included in the Contract in order to provide

for continuity of service; and

WHEREAS, it is the recommendation of the Department of Public Works that the

City enter into the Contract with the Contractor for a period of one (1) year from July 1,2018



tl, .r t

through June 30, 2019, and reserve the right to extend the Contract for two (2) additional

periods of one (1) year thereafter, at the option of the City.

NOW, THEREF'ORE, THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WILMINGTON

HEREBY ORDAINS:

SECTION 1. Contract 19017PW - Gasoline/Heating Oil/DieselrFuel - between the

City of Wilmington and Riggins, Inc., a copy of which Contract is attached hereto as Exhibit

"A," for the period of one (1) year from July I,2018 through June 30, 2019, at an estimated

price of One Million One Hundred Sixty-Nine Thousand Six Hundred Sixty Dollars

($1,169,660.00), with the possibility of two (2) additional extensions of one (1) year

thereafter at the same annual price, at the option of the City, is hereby approved, and the

Mayor and the City Clerk are hereby authorized and directed to execute as many copies of

the Contract, as well as all additional undertakings related thereto, as may be necessary.

SECTION 2. This Ordinance shall become effective upon its passage by City

Council and approval by the Mayor.

First Reading....
Second Reading,
Third Reading...

Passed by City Council,

June 7,2018
June 7,2018

President of City Council

ATTEST
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City Clerk



Approved this _ day of _,2018

Mayor

SYNOPSIS: This Ordinance authorizes the execution of Contract l9017PW
GasolineiHeating Oil/Diesel Fuel - between the City of Wilmington and Riggins, Inc. for the
period of one (1) year from July I,2018 through June 30, 2019, at an estimated price of One

Million One Hundred Sixty-Nine Thousand Six Hundred Sixty Dollars ($1,169,660.00), with
the possibility of two (2) additional extensions of one (1) year thereafter at the same annual
price, at the option of the City.

FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT: The fiscal impact of this Ordinance is a contract for the
period of one (1) year from July 1,2018 through June 30, 2019, at an estimated price of One
Million One Hundred Sixty-Nine Thousand Six Hundred Sixty Dollars ($1,169,660.00), with
the possibility of two (2) additional extensions of one (1) year thereafter at the same annual
price, at the option of the City.

w0099656
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EXHIBIT A



Ad Number: OOO277342L Run Dates: 03/06/18, O3l13l1B

The City of Wilmington
will receive sealed bids

at the Division of Procurement &
Records,sth Fl., Louis L. Redding
Bldg.,800 French S1., Wilm., DE

19801 for:
1 SOl7PW _ GASOLINE, HEATING

OIL & DIESEL FUEL
Bid opening: Tuesday, March 27,
2018, at 3:00 p.m., in the Sth Floor
Finance Conference Room, Louis L.
Redding City/County Building, 800
French Slreet, Wilmington, DE
1980't.
Specifications may be obtained at
the above address for the Division
of Procurement & Records.
Philip Ceresini
Purchasing Agent ll
Division of Procuremenl and
Records
Department of Finance
3/6' 3/13-NJ 

40277?t2t-ol



THE
NEWS
fguRl'lAL

Classified Ad ReceiPt
(For lnfo Only - NOT A BILL)

CVstomer:

Address:

Run Times: 2

SD CITY WLM PURCHASING DIV

8OO N FRENCH ST FL 5

WILMINGTON DE 19801

USA

Ad No.:

Pymt Method

NetAmt:

No. of Affidavits: 1

0002773421

lnvoice

$134.88

Run Dates: 03/06/18, 03/13/18

Text ofAd:

tl* a'tt of Wilmington
will receive sealed bids

at the Divisiqn of Procurement &
Records, 5th Fl., Louis L. Redding
Bldg.,800 French 5t., Wilm., DE

'19801 forl
I9O17PW _ GASOLINE, HEATING

OIL & DIESEL FUEL
Bid openlng: Tuesday, March 27,
2018, at 3:00 p.m., in the 5th Floor
Finance Conference Room, Louis L.

Redding City/County Building. 800
French Street, Wilmington, DE
1 9801.
Snocifications mav be obtained at
.' tbove addresi for the Division
'.. .ocurement & Records.
Philio Ceresini
Purchasing Agent ll
Division of Procurement and
Records
Department of Finance
3/6;3/13-NJ
#0711)421-0t

3600 Highway 66, Neptune, NJ 07753



{Fff*[H:l3urno,A GAHNETT COMPANY

Street Address:
950 West Basin Road
New Castle,DE19720

Mailing Address:
P.O. Box 15505
Wilmington, DE 19850

Legal Desk:
(302t32+%76
Legal Fax:
302324-2249

(3o2)
(Boo)

324-25ffi
235-9100

SD CIry WILM PURCHASING DIV
8OO N FRENCH ST FL 5

WLMINGTON, DE 19801 DE,

AF'F'IDAVIT OF PUBLICATION

State of Delaware
New Castle County

Personally appeared The News Journal

Of the The News Journal Media Group, a newspaper printed, published and circulated in the State of Delaware, who
being duly sworn, deposeth and saith that the advertisement of which the annexed is a true copy, has been published in the

i said newspaper2 times, once in each issue as follows:

03/06/18, 03i 13/18 A .D 2018

SU before me, 13 day of
2018

AdNumber: OOO277342L Legal notification printed at larger size for affidavit.
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CitY of WilrninSfon

MICHAEL S. PURZYCKT
I\{a;-or

Advertisement for Bids to appear in the News Journal
on Tuesday, March 6ft and Tuesday, March 13th,2018.

The City of Wilmington will receive sealed bids
at the Division of Procurement & Records, 5th Fl., Louis L. Redding Bldg,,

800 French St., Wilm., DE 19801 for:

19O17PW _ GASOLINE, HEATING OIL & DIESEL FUEL

iid opening: Tuesday, March 27,2018, at 3:00 p.m., in the 5th Floor Finance Conference Room, Louis L.
Redding City/County Building, 800 French Street, Wilmington, DE 19801

Specifications may be obtained at the above address for the Division of Procurement & Records.

Philip Ceresini
Purchasing Agent II
Division of Procurement and Records
Department of Finance

pceresini@wi lmin gtonde. eov
www.wilmingtonde.gov

l,OUI.S 1.. RtIDDtNC CI f\'/COUNTY llUll-DING . 800 FRENCII Sl RLt-T . \\rlLlllNGTOn*. DELA\Yr\RE . 19801-3537
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ADDENDUM #1

Contract 19017PW
Gasoline Heating Oil & Diesel Fuel

In response to questions and comments that have been received we offer the following

updates, clarifications. Note that only questions that were determined to be relevant have

been addressed.

l. W.ho is your current vendor?

Riggins Oil
2. please provide current copies of invoices and bill of ladings for each product.

FOIA Request Required - Form Sent

3. Are vendors required to bid on all products?

No
4. Can vendors only bid on tanker loads?

Yes
5. Are the options to extend the contract upon mutual agreement of both parties?

No
6. Are you billed on gross or net gallons?

Net
7. Is the heating oil required to be ultra-low Sulphur?

Yes
g. Because the DE Gross Receipt tax is based on a percentage on all product dollars,

we request that it be allowed to be a line item and not incorporated into the

delivery fee. This will ensure that all quotes submitted are being compared

equally. It will also assist in keeping the cost to the city down, because this tax is

u p"r""ntrge based on total product dollars, the tax will change as the OPIS index

"hung", 
,o Bidd".u will use an inflated delivery fee to cover the risk this tax will

"uurJ. 
By having the tax as a line item, the bidders can give the most completive

delivery fee possible to the cifY.

We q,ould agree to this change in the addendum'

a ieir
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9. When is the award date?' 
Usually within 30 days of the bid opening.

10. When is the first board meeting after the opening?
N/A

11. Will decision be made before or at the board meeting?
N/A

12. Will a firm fixed price be considered? If not, why?
No

13. If we were to insert any conditions into our altemate firm fixed bid, would they be

taken into consideration or rejected? Sample attached, please indicate which
clauses would be acceptable and which clauses would be cause for rejection?

No
14. Have any addendums been released for this bid?

This is Addendum #1

15. Does the City of Wilmington require dyed or clear diesel fuel for this
procurement?
The City requires dyed heating oil for the generators at its Water Plant facilities,

however we'll also require clear diesel for motor vehicle use at the Fire Stations,

and the Public Works Yard at 1450 New York Ave.

ALL OT}IER PROVISIONS OF THIS SOLICITATION REMAIN THE SAME.

Issued 26March20l8 by the

Procurement and Records Division, Department of Finance

Louis L. Redding City County Building, 800 French Street
Wilmington, DE 19801
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INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

l. Bids on City Contract 19017PW - GASOLINE, HEATING OIL & DIESEL FUEL willbe publicly

pened and read aloud in the 5th Floor Finance Conference Room, Louis L. Redding City/County Building, 800

French Street, Wilmington, DE 19801 on TUESDAY, MARCH27,2018, AT 3:00 p.m.

2. Proposals must be in triplicate, sealed in an envelope, and the envelope endorsed "Bid for City Contract

19017PW - GASOLINE, HEATING OIt & DIESEL FUEL" and addressed to the Department of Finance,

Division of Procurement and Records,.5th Floor, Louis L. Redding City/County Building, 800 French Street, Wilmin$on,

Delaware.

3. Any bid may be withdrawn prior to the schedule time for opening of bids or authorized postponement thereof' No

bid may be withdrawn within thirry (30) calendar days after the actual opening thereof.

4. The successful bidder will be required to have or obtain an appropriate business license from the Department of
Finance, n"uenue piviiion, City of Wilmington, in order to be awarded the contract. Before obtaining a City of
Wilmington Business License, all applicants must show proof of a current State of Delaware Business License.

5. The corporation, the successful bidder shall furnish a certificate from the State where it is incorporated, stating

that it is a subsiiting corporation. The corporation shall also furnish one (1) original and two (2) copies of the excerpts of
the corporate minutes, *tri.fr grant authority to those who sign and attest the contract. The Corporate Seal shall be affixed

where signatures are attested.

6. The successful bidder will be required to withhold City of Wilmington Wage Tax from their employees and

withheld t-xes paiA to ttre City of Wilmington prirsuant to the piovisions of the Wilmington Wage Tax Law. This law

applies to people living and/or working in the City of Wilmington.

. The U.S. Department of Commerce monitors Procurement transaction made to minority business enterprises by

the City of Wilmington. The Minority Business Developments Agency's District Office reserves the right to contact the

successful minority bidder and/or subcontractor to confirm any participation in the Procurement process.

8. The successful bidder certifies that they are not listed on the Federal Government, Excluded Parties List System

(www.sam.sov). This will be verified by the City of Wilmington and if listed may be grounds for rejection of the bid or

proposal.

9. Any person doing business or s6eking to do business with the City shall abide by the following Global Sullivan

Princinles:

A. Support universal hurnan rights and particularly, those of employees, the communities within which you

operate, and parties with whom you do business.

B. promote equal opportunity for employees at all levels of the company with respect to issues such as color,

race, gender, age, ethnicity, or religious beliefs, and operate without unacceptable worker treatment such

as the exploitation of children, physical punishment, female abuse, involuntary servitude, or other forms

of abuse.

C. Respect employee's voluntary freedom of association.

D. , Compensate employees to enable them to meet at least their basic needs and provide the opporfunity to

improve their skill and capability in order to raise their social and economic opporrunities.

IB-I



Provide a safe and healthy workplace; protect human health and the environment; and promote

sustainable development.

Promote fair competition including respect for intellectual and other property rights, and not offer,.pay, or

accept bribes.

Work with governments and communities in which you do business to improve the quality of life in those

communities -- their educational, cultural, economic, and social well-being -- and seek to provide training

and opportunities for workers from disadvantaged backgrounds.

H. Promote the application of these principles by those.with whom you do business

10. Award and Execu f ion of Contracf

A Consideration of Proposals. After the proposals are opened and read, they will be compared on the

basis of the summation of the products of the approximate quantities shown in the bid schedule by the

unit bid prices, unless the proposals states a different basis for comparing bids. In the event of a

discrepancy between unit bid prices and extensions, the unit bid price shall govern.

Before awarding the contract, a bidder may be required to show that he/she has the ability, experience,

necessary equipment, experienced personnel, and financial resources to successfully carry out the work

required by the contract.

The right is reserved to reject any and/or all propgsals, to waive technicalities, to advertise for new

proposals, or to proceed to do the work otherwise, if in the judgment of the department the best interest of
the City will be promoted thereby.

B. Award of Contract. The award of the contract, if it be awarded, must be within thirfy (30) calendar days

after the opening of proposals to the lowest responsible and qualified bidder whose proposal complies

with all the requirements prescribed. The successful bidder will be notified by letter mailed to the address

shown on his proposals that his bid has been accepted and has been awarded the contract.

Cancellation of Award. The City reserves the right to cancel the award of any contract at any time

before the execution of said contract by all parties without any liability against the City.

Right to Audit. The City Auditor or his designee shall have the right to audit the contract and any books,

documents, or records relating thereto,

Questions should be directed to Phil Ceresini via email at pceresini@wilminstonde.gov. Questions will not be accepted

within 1 week of bid opening.

THIS CONTRACT DOES NOT REQUIRB A BID BOND OR PERFORMANCE BOND

E.

F.

G

C.

D.
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CITY OF WILMII\G TON" DBLAWARE

SPECIFICATIONS FOR CONTRACT

GASOLINE / HEATING OIL / DIESEL FUEL

CONTRACT 19O17PW

City of Wilmington

Department of Public Works

February 27,2018



CITY OF WILMINGTON
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

GASOLINE, HEATING OIL AND DIESEL FUEL
Contract 19017PW

S IFICATI S:
Petroleum products
this contract will be
below. Vendors can

sold to the City of Wilmington under the Terms and Conditions of

tested according to the procedures and specifications outlined

bid wagon Loads, Tanker Loads (8,500), or a combination of both:

Gasoline to conform to the ASTM Designation D439"79 or most current revision

thereof: the antiknock requirement for gasoline shall be as follows:

Antiknock lndex
Minimum

87.0 octane

Ethanol Content /Gal.
Maximum

15%

Heating Oil to conform to the ASTM Designation for #2 Heating Oil, D396 or most

current revision. The heating oil shall also comply with the requirement of Ultra Low

Sutptrur 15 ppM maximum. rf''" City will not accept DYED ULSD in lieu of Heating Oil.

Diesel Fuel to conform to the ASTM designation D975 or most current revision for

ULSD 1lZ-lS ppM of Sulfur). Suppliers and their sources are prohibited from

aJutteraiing the fuel with reclaimed oi waste products of any type. The fuel is to be

completer/oirtitt"o materials. That is, the fuel should.show at least 98 percent of

uoruinu ,".ou"ry when subjected to ASTM D-86 (or latest version) distillation. Fuel is to

meet WF-800 lgrades or-1 and DF-2) and ASTM Designation D-975. Fuel is to be

"tu"n 
and free'6f contamination of any kind. The cetane number rating mus_t be a

minimum of 40 and the final boiling poini is to be 675 degrees Fahrenheit. The city will

not accept 5% or 2% bio in your diesel. I

TERM:
Jnffiitiut term of this contract shall be July 1,2018, or as soon as possible thereafter,

to June 30, 201g. The city of wilmington maintains the option to extend this contract

fortwo (2) additional periods of one (liyeareach whicn wiit run from July 1't until June

30,n. fermr and conditions of the contract must remain the same; The City will give 60

days advanced written notice if the contract is to be extended.

s-2



PRICING METHOD:
For allluel products the bidder must complete the proposal form at the end of this

document. The delivered price per gallon of Gasoline / Heating Oil / Diesel Fuelwill be

calculated for each product as follows: the daily OPIS Contract Low Rack price for
philadelphia, PA at 5:00 pm for the day of delivery plus the delivery fee (fixed for the

term of the contract) from the proposal form. The City of Wilmington is exempt from

Federal and State excise taxes. Additional charges to appear separately on the invoice

are:

Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) Fee

Federal Oil Spill Recovery Fee
Delaware Hazard Substance Clean

A copy of the February 15,2018 OPIS Contract Report for 5:00 pm is attached to this

document for reference as Attachment A. Additionally, the base price on the proposal

form is derived from the February 15,2018 report. The prices on the proposal form are

for comparison only. lnvoiced pricing will fluctuate as detailed above'

ESTIMATED QUANTITIES:
@intheattachedproposalformsareusedasbasisofcomparisonof
bids. Actual quantities purchased will be governed by need. The City reserves the right

to change, add, or delete delivery locations within the City limits as needed.

TAXES:
The price quoted on all products shall be exempt from Federal, State, or local taxes.

Tax exempt certificates will be supplied to the successful bidder(s) (license #21131)

GEN L
All ltems of .this specification shall meet or excee d Federal and /or State regulations with

reference to air,, water, storage, and pollution regulations. The initial term of this contract

will be from date of signed contract to June 30, 2019 with possible extensions as

described above.

s-3



DELIVERY:
Delivery shall be made to the tanks at several locations, Monday through Friday,
between 6:00 a.m. and 6:00 p.m., and anytime when requested for an emergency
delivery. When verbally ordered, normal delivery shall be made within 24 hours of
receipt of the order.

The successful bidder shall supply a toll-free number where such orders may be placed.
Should the successful bidder fail to make delivery of the fuel oil and the diesel or
heating oil systems run out of fuel, he shall be liable for all the expenses for the repairs
and maintenance to the equipment, including the expense of resetting the pumps
restoring burners, cleaning nozzles, and ignition systems. Upon failure to deliver as
requested, the City may at their discretion, arrange for another source of fuel oil and the
vendor shall be liable for reimbursement to the City for any increase in costs resulting
there from.

Emergency deliveries may be requested and an after-hours delivery charge is to be
entered on proposal sheet for this purpose.

Should any fuel delivered prove not to meet the specified standards, the successful
bidder shall remove such fuel, replace with specified fuel, and bear the costs of the task.
The successful bidder shall remove condensate and other foreign heavy material from
the tanks as required, at no additional cost.

METERED .QELIYFRIES:
All fuel deliveries must be made by trucks equipped with a meter and printed tickets
The printed tickets must indicate readings before and after loading into storage tanks
Copies of the associated delivery tickets are to be sent with the invoices.

AUTOMATIC DELIVERIES:
The Successful Bidder must make automatic deliveries as required based on
automatically faxed tank levels supplied daily by the City's Veeder Root System and the
future deliveries are to be confirmed in advance with the City's designate by email
(designate to be determined at bid award). Successful bidder shall supply a

coordinating company contact individual to receive the subject City's tank level faxes.
The automatic deliveries pertain to the 1450 New York Ave location fuel site at present
but may include other locations later at the discretion of the City. Bidder must'take
exception to this requirement, if compliance is not expected.

s-4



INVOICES:
Vendor shall issue a separate invoice for each location and delivery. Delivery location
and purchase order number must show on each invoice along with a copy of delivery
sheet and daily OPIS rack price listing used for that day. lnvoices, OPIS, and copy of
the delivery sheet are to be sent to the Finance Department, Accounts Payable via

email to: accountspavable@wilminqtonde.qov and laobohoski@wilminqtonde.qov The
invoiced quantity of any delivery must match the corresponding delivered quantity as

shown on the metered delivery sheet for that delivery. lf the quantities of product, OPIS

Contract Low Rack Price Sheet, and delivery ticket do not match, the invoice will be

held up for payment until reconciliation is made.
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DELIVERY LOCATIONS

GASOLINE SMALL TANK 5OOO GALLONS OR LESS

Public Safetv Buildinq One
300 N Walnut Street
One (1) 3,000 gallon tank (in-ground)

Fire Department:
Old Swedes Landing Road
At foot of East 4th Street Bridge
One (1) -500 gallon tank (Skid Tank, above ground)

GASOLINE LARGE TANK 5OO1 GALLONS OR MORE

Motor Vehicle Division: (Supervisor - Leonard Obohoski or designate at 302-576-
3073)

Public Works Yard at the City's Municipal Complex 1450 New York Ave.
(Enter through gate at 500 Wilmington Ave.) Gate access code required
One (1) 10,000 gal, above-ground tank
One (1) 12,000 gal, above-ground tank

HEATING OIL (ULSD) SMALL TANKS SOOO GALLONS OR LESS

Porter Gatehouse
2052 E. Park Drive
One ('1) 275 Gallon, above ground, 15 PPM USLD heating oil tank

Porter Filter Plant
2052 E. Park Drive
One (1) - 15 PPM ULSD heating oil, above-ground, 5,000 gallon tank

s-6



HEATING OIL (USLD) LARGE TANKS 5OO1 GALLONS OR MORE

Water Department: (Supervisor - Joe Dellose at3O2-576-5461)

Brandywine Plant
16th & French Streets
One (1)10,000 gallon, vaulted underground storage tank, 15 PPM USLD heating oil

DIESEL FUEL (USLD) SMALL TANKS & GE NERATORS 5000
GALLONS OR LESS

Public Works Department: (Supervisor - Sam Baise at302-420-8602)

Public Works Yard at the City's Municipal Complex 145ONew York Ave.
(Enter through gate at 500 Wilmington Ave.) Gate access code required
Two (2) - ULSD, 500 gal., above- ground tanks (emergency generator tanks)

Water Department: (Supervisor - Joe Dellose at 302-576-5461)

Porter Filter Plant electrical substation - 2052 E. Park Drive, 19803
One (1) - ULSD, above-ground, 1,200 gallon tank

Porter Filter Plant - Alapocas pump Station - 2052 E. Park Drive, 19803
One (1) - ULSD, 500 gallon tank, above-ground

Kennett Pike - 1125 DuPont Road, 19807
One (1) ULSD, 100 gallon, above ground tank

Hillcrest Pump Station, 503 Hillcrest Avenue, 19809
One (1) ULSD, 100 Gallon, above ground tank

New Castle Pump Station, 4125 New Castle Avenue, 19720
One (1) ULSD, 75 gallon, above ground tank

Cool Springs Station at Gate House, 1001 Van Buren Streets, 19806
One (1) 15 PPM ULSD, 1,0OO^gallon, in-ground tank

s-7



Fire Department: (Supervisor - Chief Jerome McCaffery or designate at
302-576-3151)

Station #3
At 30th and Northeast Blvd.
One (1) ULSD, 550 gallon, in-ground tank

Station #2
At New Castle Ave
One (1) ULSD,275 gallon, in-ground tank

Fire Boat
Old Swedes Landing Road
At foot of East 4th Street Bridge
One (1) ULSD 5,000 gallon, tank located on boat at dock

Station #'1

At 2nd and West St.
One (1) ULSD,3,000 gallon, above ground tank

Police Athletic eaoue Buildino: (Supervisor - George Giles or designate at,302-576-
3e14)
3707 N Market Street
One (1) ULSD, 500 Gallon above-ground tank

William Hick Anders Communitv Genter (contact - U'Gandi Jacobs, 302-571-
4266)
501 Madison Street
One ('l) ULSD, 500 Gallon above-ground tank

DIESEL FUEL (USLD) LARGE TANKS (5001 to 15000 oallons Tank)

Motor Vehicle Division: (Supervisor - Leonard Obohoski or designate at 302-576-
3073)

Public Works Yard at the City's Municipal Complex 1450 New York Ave.
(Enter through gate at 500 Wilmington Ave.) Gate access code required
Two (2) 6,000 gallon ULSD, above ground, manifolded tanks (automatic delivery)
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Site Visits:

Bidders may make arrangements with site supervisors to visit the tank locations before
bidding. Questions related to the bids must go to Phil Ceresini, City of Wilmington
Purchasing Department via email at pceresini@wilmingtonde.gov .

Questions will not be accepted within one (1) week of bid opening date.

The City retains the right to split the award of each item to separate bidders.
The City also reserves the right to change or add, delivery locations within the
City limits as needed during the term of this contract.

EXCEPTIONS
Any exceptions submitted to these specifications and attachments must be submitted by
the bidder on company letterhead and enclosed with the bid

5-9



c3ft?Rl8+lJfi?Hi,
GASOLINE / HEATING OIL / DIESEL FUEL

Your City of Wilmington Business License is

This proposal is submitted with the knowledge that the Department of Finance, Division

of procurement and Records, reserve the right to reject any and all proposals when,

and in its judgment, and is in the best interest of the City of Wilmington to do so.

We, the undersigned, hereby agree to furnish and deliver per the specifications, the

items listed below to the City of Wilmington, at various locations between start of

contract through June 30, 2019, with possible extensions as described above.

THE CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO SPLTT THE AWARD TO MULTIPLE

VENDORS.

Gasoline Small Tank 5000 Gallons or Less

Approximately 20,000 gallons of UNLEADED REGULAR, delivered F.O.B. to locations

in Wilmington, Delaware as delivered by waqon load'

Estimated Gallons

OPIS Low Rack (February 15,2018)

Quoted Delivery Fee Per gallon

Delivered Cost per gallon

Total Cost for 20,000 gallons

20,000

$1.6725

(OPIS plus Quoted DeliverY Fee)

(Delivered Cost Gallon, multiplied by gallons)
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PROPOSAL FORM, 
CONTRACT 19O17PW

GASOLINE / HEATING OIL / DIESEL FUEL

Gasoline La roe Tank 5001 Gallons or More

Approximately 325,000 gallons of UNLEADED REGULAR, delivered F.O.B. to locations

in Wilmington, Delaware as delivered by tanker load

Estimated Gallons

OPIS Low Rack (February 15,2018)

Quoted Delivery Fee per gallon

Delivered Cost per gallon

Total Cost for 325,000 gallons
(Delivered Cost Gallon, multiplied by gallons)

Heatinq Oil Small Tank 5000 Gallons or Less:

Approximately 50,000 gallons of HEATING OlL, ULSD, delivered F.O.B. to locations
in Wilmington, Delaware as delivered by wagon load.

Estimated Gallons

OPIS Low Rack (February 15,2018)

Quoted Delivery Fee per gallon

Delivered Cost per gallon

Total Cost for 50,000 gallons

50,000

$1.8470

(Delivered Cost Gallon, multiplied by gallons)

325,000

$1.6725

(OPIS plus Quoted Delivery Fee)

(OPIS plus Quoted Delivery Fee)

PF-2



PROPOSAL FORM
CONTRACT 19O17PW

GASOLINE / HEATING OIL / DIESEL FUEL

Heatinq Oil La rqe Tank 5001 Gallo ns or More:

Approximately 50,000 gallons of HEATING OlL, USLD, delivered F.O.B. to locations
in Wilmington, Delaware as delivered by tanKer load.

Estimated Gallons

OPIS Low Rack (February 15,2018)

Quoted Delivery Fee per gallon

Delivered Cost per gallon

Total Cost for 50,000 gallons

55,000

$1.8470

(Delivered Cost Gallon, multiplied by.gallons)

Diesel Fuel Small Tan 5000 Gallons or Less:

Approximately 25,000 gallons of Diesel Fuel, USLD, delivered F.O.B. to locations
in Wilmington, Delaware as delivered by waqon load

(OPIS plus Quoted Delivery Fee)

Estimated Gallons

OPIS Low Rack (February 15,2018)

Quoted Delivery Fee per gallon

Delivered Cost per gallon

Total Cost for 25,000 gallons

25,000

$1.9165

(OPIS plus Quoted Delivery Fee)

(Delivered Cost Gallon, multiplied by gallons)

P F-3



PROPOSAL FORM
CONTRACT 19O17PW

GASOLINE / HEATING OIL / DIESEL FUEL

Diese I Fuel Laroe Tank 5001 Gal lons or More:'

Approximately 165,000 gallons of Diesel Fuel, USLD, delivered F.O.B. to locations
in Wilmington, Delaware as delivered by tanker load.

Estimated Gallons

OPIS Low Rack (February 15,2018)

Quoted Delivery Fee per gallon

Delivered Cost per gallon

Total Cost for 165,000 gallons

'165,000

$1 .9165

(OPIS plus Quoted Delivery Fee)

(Delivered Cost Gallon, multiplied by gallons)

PF-4



d Total:

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY CONTACT NAME & TEL #
PF-5

PROPOSAL FORM
CONTRACT 19O17PW

GASOLINE / HEATING OIL / DIESEL FUEL

(Total of all above sections

FIRM:

Corporation / Partnership / lndividual

PER

Name (Typed of Printed)

TITLE:

SIGNATURE

ADDRESS

CITY, STATE ZIP:

PHONE:

FAX:

EMAIL:

FED TAX ID



Attachment A

Account. #24998:]

To align t.he folLowing data, change the font size to 9 in Courier Ne$,,

PHILADELPHIA, PA 201,8-02-15 17:00:50 EST
**OPIS CLOSING BENCHMARK FILE**

* *OPTS GROSS RFG ET}IANOL (].0? ) PRTCES* *
MoVe
Date

Petrocom
PESRM
UEPT
Sprague
GULF-GTE
Monroe En
Buckeye
AmerGreen
s.R.& M.
Citgo
She11
Coastal
Sunoco
Valero
Gulf
BP
XOM

PBFEnergy
LOW RACK
HIGH RACK
RACK AVG

.05
ao

.91

.91

.85

.zu

.53

.75
,84

r-93
1_87

r87

186
190
1,92
l-85
114

l- 93
r-83

1-7

55
56

90
97
70
n)
9B
L7
96

u
u
u
u
u
u
u
u
u
b
b
b
b
b
b
b
b
u

Terms
Net
N- l-0
Net
N- 1-0

Net
Net
l--l-0
N- 10
l_-10
l--10
].25-3
125-3
L25-3
t_ - t-0
t--10
t_-10
r--10
Net

Unl
1"67 .25
158,54o
159.40
1"69 .60
L69.15
1,69 .7 5
L70.90
r7L .69
1-73 .7I
r-75.53
L75 .96
L't6.06
L76.06
L76.30
1-76.3s
]-76.37
1-77 . rO
L77.72
L6't ,25
L77.72
173.50

Move Move Time
19:00
1B;00
1B:00
l-8:00
1B:00
L8:00
1?:00
l-7 r 00
t 8:00
1B:00
18:00
1-8:01
1B:01
1-8:'00
l-B:00
l-B:00
1,9: 00
L8: 00

+4
+

2tr

. t-5

.35

.'tL

.80

Mid Move Pre
I'72.98 + 2.23 L8l-.95 +
174.88o + 4.25 187.50o +

176.03
L80.45

187.05
]_86.75
1"87 .7 5
185.90
187.53
209.38
202 .67
226.59
23,4 .90
214 :90
21"1 .30
204 .80
22L.27
227.60
r.9s.96
r-81.9s
227.60
202 .96

35 O2/r4
46 02/1,4
-- 02/1.4
89 O2/r4
BO 02/ 1_4

2s 02/14
50 o2/r4
47 02/74
7r 02/14
04 02/1,4
38 02/1.4
9t 02 / 1,4

91 02 /'t 4
8s 02/L4
20 02/1,4
s3 02/L4
7s 02/'J-4
7L 02/),4

a

4

-1
+2
+3
+2
+2
+2

+1

+l-
+z
+1
+2
+2

+

+3

+2
L)

+2
+1

+1
+2
r1

+2
+2

+z

+3

+z
,a

+2
+l-

.55

.80

.25

.50

.48

.71

.04

.38

.91

.91

.20

.53

.75

.79

t-

z2
50
47
71_

T7
I7
T7
18
18

5.5
o.z
6.9
q?
8.0

0

0

4
o

o

+2
+l-
+)

+z

oPIS GULF COAST SPOT MEAN - O2/L4
FOB COLONIAL L70.250

OPIS GUI,F COAST DEI,TVERED SPOT (SRI) }4AIN
FOB PHII,ADELPHIA L72,37 176 .A6

OPIS ITAUREL DEI'TVERED SPOT (SRI)
FOB PHII,ADELPHTA I7O .L2 .J.75.32

OPIS NYH BARGE DEI,IVERED SPOT (SRT)
FOB PHTI,ADEI,PHIA ].71. 08 175.30

OPIS LINDBN iTUNCTION DELIVERED SPOT (SRI)
FOB PHTU\DELPHIA I72.43

BRD LOW RACK 175 . 53 1-86. 90
BRD HTGH RACK I77.7O 'J-93.I7
BRD RACK AVG 1"'16 -22 189.55
uBD LOW RACK :-6't.25 L72.98
UBD HIGH RACK I'77.72 189.38
UBD RACK AVG ].71..09 179.06
coNT AVG:02/15 1,73.50 183.95
coNT LOW-o2/r-s L6't.2s 1"72.98
coNT HIGH- 02/1-5 r17 .72 r93 . r7
o=out of producL

r_81-.83

1-83 .3-2

l-84. t_3

202 .67
227.60
215.50
181.95
209 .38
3-90 .41-
202 .96
l-8r-.95
227.60

PHTI,ADELPHIA, PA-N,f
LOW RETA]L
AVG RETAIL
LOW RETAIL EX_TAX
AVG RETAIL EX.TAX

240 .63
27 6 .23
185.08
206 .20

oPrs-1



I

Attachment A

PHII,ADELPHIA, PA

Huguenot. u N-10 1-9L.55
UEPT u Net L92.30
Petrocom u Net. ]-92.45
Monroe En u Net 193.25
BP. b l_-10 L94.42
S.R.& M. u 1-10 ]-94.58
Buckeye u L-L0 ::..95.2O
Coastal .b l-25-3 L95.27
Sunoco b l-25-3 l.95.27
Amercreen u N-l-0 1,95.75
PESRM u N-10 t96.2Lo
PBFEnergy u Neb L96.49
Sprague u L-Lo 1,96.67
LOW RACK L91.55
HIGH RACK 19.6 .67
RACK AVG 1.94 .44
OPIS GULF COAST SPOT MEAN -

FOB COLONIAI 1"84.1L5

2018-02-L5 l-7: 00:50 EST
**OPTS CLOSING BENCHMARK FTLE**

**OPTS GROSS ULTRA LOW SULFUR DTSTILI,ATE PRICES**

Terms No.2 Move No.1 Move Pre

1,96 . 02

Move

+ 4.1O

+ 4.45

Move
Date
02 /'t 4
02 /),4
02/L4
02/1.4
02/L4
02 / 1-4

02 / 1"4

02/t4
02/14
02/14
02/t4
02/14
02/14

Time
18:00
18:00
19:00
l-8: 00
18:00
18:00
l-7:00
1B:00

+5
+

+4
+5
+2
+4
+4
+4
+4
+4
+

+4
+4

.10
)q

.75

.25
)t

.70

.50

.30

.70

.46

.68

.84

.55

236

236
236
)1R

23

23
23
al

l-8
T'71,98 .22

00
00
00
00
00

10

18
l-8

OPIS GUI,F COAST DE],IVERED SPOT (SRT) MAIN
FOB PHII,ADE],PHTA 190,L7

OPIS LAUREL DELIVERED SPOT (SRI)
FOB PHILADELPHIA ].88. ].4

OPIS NYH BARGE DELIVERED SPOT (SRT)
FOB PHTLADEIJPHIA 189.55

OPIS I,INDEN.WNCTION DEIJTVERED SPOT (SRI)
FOB PHII.ADELPHIA ]- 9b . 4 O

BRD LOW RACK 1-94.42
BRD HIGH RACK :-95,27
BRD RACK AVG T94.99
uBD LOW RACK l-91.55 236 .23
UBD HIGH RACK 1"96.67 236.23
UBD RACK AVG L94.26 236.23
coNT AVG-02/r-5 194.44 236.23
coNT LOW-02/15 r-91.65 236.23
coNT HrcH- o2/t5 'J,96 .67 236 .23
o=ouL of product,

02/L4

+ 3.60

796
198
L97

184

r92

190

t-9L

792

22
)-2

l-t-5

42

39

90

55

L96 . 02
1"98.22
]-97.'J-2
1-97 . L2
]-96 . 02
1-98 .22

oPts-2



PHILADELPHTA, PA

Attachment A

20L8-02-15 1-7:00:50 EST
**OPIS CLOSING BENCHMARK FILE**

**OPIS GROSS ULTRA LOW SULFUR RED DYE DTSTILIJATE PRICES**

Terms No.2 Move No. 1 Move Pre
Huguenot
UEPT
Pet,rocom
Monroe En
s.R.& M.
Buckeye
Coastal
Sunoco
AmerGreen
PESRM
PBFEnergy

N- 10
Net
NeL
Net
l--10
1--10
L25-3
L2s-3
N- L0
N- l-0
Net

L92 .75
),92 .7 5
t92 .90
L93 .64
195.08
1_95.70
1"95.77
195 .77
]-96.24
l-95.60o
]-96 .99

196 -52 +

L96.52
L96 .52
L96.52

t92.77

190.74

L92.25

193.00

t96.52
L95.52
L96 .52
L96.52
L96.52
L96 .52

Move

4.70

Move
Date
02 / 1,4

02/t4
02 / 1,4

02/1.4
02/L4
02/L4
02/L4
02/ 14
02/74
02/74
02 / 1.4

02 / 1,5

Time
l-8:00
l-B:00
19:00
18r00
l-8:00
l-7:00
L8:00
1B:00
17:00
l-B: 00
18:00
00:01

u
u
u
u
u
u
b
b
u
u
u

+5
+
+4
+5
+4
+4
+4
+4
+4
+
+4

. l-0

.25

.70

.25

.?o

.50

.30

.70

.45

.58

.84
Pet.rolube u N- l-5 218 . 53 - . B0
IJOW RACK Lg2 . T5
HIGH RACK 218.53
RACK AVG T96.87
OPTS GULF COAST DELIVERED SPOT (SRT) MATN

FOB PHIITADELPHIA T9O .52
OPIS LAUREI, DELIVERED SPOT (SRT)

FOB PHILADELPHTA ].88.49
OPIS NYH BARGE DELIVERED SPOT (SRT)

FOB PHTI.ADELPHTA ].90. OO

OPIS LINDEN .TUNCTION DELIVERED SPOT (SRI)
FOB. PHII,ADELPHIA 1.90. ?5

BRD LOW RACK 'J,95.77
BRD HTGH RACK T95.77
BRD RACK AVG 1"95.77
UBD LOW RACK A92.15
UBD HTGH RACK 218.53
UBD RACK AVG +97.1J
coNT AVG-02/15 t96.8'1
coNT LOW-02/15 L92.'J.5
coNT HfGH- 02/L5 2L8. s3
o=ouL of product.

oPls-3



Attachment A

PHTLADELPHJA, PA 201-8-02-l-5 l-7:00:50 EST
**OPIS CLOSING BENCHMARK FII,E**

**OPIS GROSS HEATING OIL DISTILI'ATE PRICES**
Move

Terms HEAT Move Date Time
PESRM

UEPT
s.R.&. M.
Buckeye
Sprague
Petrolube
LOW RACK
HIGH RACK
RACK AVG

1-31- .24o -
184.7O +

185.70 +

187.00 +

487.44 +

205.12
ts4,70
205,12
r-89. 99
r84.70
205.L2
:r-.89 .99
LB9 .99
L84.70
205 -]_2

3.20
.30

4.75
4.50
4 .54

.85

02/L4
02/14
02/L4
02/14
02/14
02 / 1"3

18:00
18:00
L8:00
L7:00
18:00
00: 01

u N-10
.U NEL
u l_-10
u 1-l-0
u l--10
u l--l-0

UBD LOW RACK
UBD HIGH RACK
UBD RACK AVG
coNT AVG-02/1-s
coNT LOW-02/Ls
coNT HrcH-02/15
o=out of product

oPts-4



PROPOSAL FORM
CONTRACT 19O17PW

GASOLINE / HEATING OIL / DIESEL FUEL

Your City of Wilmington Business License is Ott,t0 )>
This proposal is submitted with the knowledge that the Department of Finance, Division

of procurement and Records, reserye the right to reject any and all proposals when,

and in its judgment, and is in the best intereit of tne City of Wilmington to do so.

We, the undersigned, hereby agree to furnish and deliver per the specifications, the

items listed below to the city of wilmington, at various locations between start of

contract through June 30, 2019, with possible extensions as described above.

THE CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO SPLIT THE AWARD TO MULTIPLE

VENDORS.

Gasolin e Small Tank 5000 Gal ns or Less:

Approximately 20,000 gallons of UNLEADED REGULAR, delivered F.O.B- to locations

inWilmington, Delaware as delivered by wagon load

20,000

$1.6725

,lblq
l.b3 t+q

(OPIS plus Quoted Delivery Fee)

Total Cost for 20,000 gallons
h3 oo. 00

red Cost Gallon, multiplied by gallons)

Estimated Gallons

OPIS Low Rack (February 15,2018)

Quoted Delivery Fee Per gallon

Delivered Cost Per gallon

PF-1



PROPOSAL FORM
CONTRACT 19O17PW

GASOLINE / HEATING OIL / DIESEL FUEL

Gasoline Larqe Tank 5001 Gallo ns or More:

Approximately 325,000 gallons of UNLEADED REGULAR, delivered F.O.B. to locations

in Wilmington, Delaware as delivered by tanker load-

Estimated Gallons 325,000

OPIS Low Rack (February 15, 2018) $1-6725

Quoted Delivery Fee Per gallon ,o^bs
Delivered Cost per gallon t.bqq _

plus Quoted Delivery Fee)

Total Cost for 325,000 gallons tls.00
(Deliver6d Cost Galton, multiplied by gallons)

Heatin Oil Small Tan 5000 Gallons r Less:

Approximately 50,000 gallons of HEATING OlL, ULSD, delivered F.O.B. to locations

in Wilmington, Delaware as delivered by waqon load.

. (oPrs

bss

Estimated Gallons

OPIS Low Rack (February 15,2018)

Quoted Delivery Fee Per gallon

Delivered Cost per gallon

Total Cost for 50,000 gallons

50,000

$1.8470

tblq
). oo?,1

(OPIS plus Quoted Delivery Fee)

b l0O,Qtt5 . 0
(Delivefed Cost

PF-2

, multiplied by gallons)



PROPOSAL FORM. CONTRACT 19O17PW

GASOLINE / HEATING OIL / DIESEL FUEL

Heatino o il Larqe Tank 5001 Gallons or More:

Approximately 50,000 gallons of HEATING OlL, USLD, delivered F.O.B. to locations

in'Wilmington, Delaware as delivered by tanker load'

Estimated Gallons 55'000

OPIS Low Rack (February 15,2018) $1'8470

Quoted Delivery Fee Per gallon ,031q

t-b801Delivered Cost Per gallon
(OPIS plus Quoted Delivery Fee)

* q,roq.s oo
( DeT|CEA Cost6" I lon, m u ltipl ied by g al lons)

' Total Cost for 50,000 gallons

Diesel Fuel Smal I Tank 5000 Gallons or Less:

Approximately 25,000 gallons of Diesel Fuel, USLD, delivered F.O.B. to locations

in'Wilmington, Delaware as delivered by waqon load'

Estimated Gallons

OPIS Low Rack (February 15,2018)

Quoted Delivery Fee Per gallon

Delivered Cost Per gallon

Total Cost for 25,000 gallons

25,000

$1 .9165

.?11

).t1r5
(OPIS plus Quoted Delivery Fee)

51V77.50
(Del

&

PF-3

Cost Gallon, multiplied by gallons)



PROPOSAL FORM
CONTRACT 19O17PW

GASOLINE / HEATING OIL / DIESEL FUEL

Diesel Fuel Laroe Tank 5001 Gallons or More:

Approximately 165,000 gallons of Diesel Fuel, USLD, delivered F.O.B. to locations

in Wilmington, Delaware as delivered by tankqr load-

165,000Estimated Gallons

OPIS Low Rack (February 1s,2018) $1.9165

Quoted Delivery Fee Per gallon "0q-vs

Delivered Cost per gallon t.qbl
(OPIS plus Quoted Delivery Fee)

Total Cost for 165,000 gallons
* 3-t3.5b5.00.

(Delivere'd Cost Gallon, multiplied by gallons)

PF-4



Grand Total:

PROPOSAL FORM
CONTRACT 19O17PW

GASOLINE / HEATING OIL / DIESEL FUEL

+ ll00 55.50
all above sections)

FIRM n9 Ina.
Ps*aeishipJ-ffiual

PER: n
Name (Typed of Printed)

TITLE resi clent

SIGNATU

ADDRESS 3q3E E.M n 8d

CITY, STATE ZI Uinal ancl, uJ oE3b o

PHONE: 89"- 82s--76oo

SSZ,^ 825- ADTI

EMAIL s I flSoi l.(orT1

FED TAX I *l oe*Eeoo

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY CONTACT NAME & TEL #: gn/ -g\s*lbor

2i

F

PF-s Wholt salc dt sPa+a



Department of Finance

Division of Procurement and Records

5th Floor
Louis L Redding City/ County Building
800 French St

Wilmington, DE 19801

March 9,20].8

RE: ContractI9O1-T PW- Gasoline- Heating Oil- DieselFuel

Per page S-4 of the contract specifications:

"Emergency deliveries may be requested and an after- hours delivery charge is to be entered on

the proposal sheet for this purpose."

Since no space was provided on the proposal sheet, we are indicating that charge here:

After Hours Delivery Charge: S150.00

Sincerely,

R. Pau ns
president



DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
OPERATIONS DIVISION tJ wilmington, Delaware

MEMOR ANDUM

TO: John D'amelio
Acting Manager
Division of Procurement and Records

FROM: Leonard A. Obohoski
Fleet & Contracts Administrator
Department of Public Works

DATE: 28 March 2018

SUBJECT: Contract - 19017 PW - Recommendation of award Gasoline, Heating Oil,

and Diesel Fuels.

We have reviewed the proposals for the subject specification and tabulate them as

follows: (see attached sheet from Procurement)

ffPR 16 PHff:3

BIDDER
Superior Plus EnergY
James River
Mansfield Oil
PAPCO, lnc
Petroleum Traders
Riggins

Contfact Bid Amount
$1,225,982.50

31',1it',2t333 Note Did Nor Bid Furr contract
$1,186,719.00
$1,160,157.00 Note Did NOT Bid Full Contract
$1,169,660.00

After reviewing the bids, we are recommending the apparent low bidder who bid the

contract in its entiretY.

Riggins should be awarded this contract in the total amount of $1,169,660.00 for the

Oeiivery of Gasoline/Heating Oil and Diesel Fuels for the City of Wilmington.

APPROVED

Williams
COMMISSIONER OF PUBLIC WORKS

Vincent Carroccia
Phil Ceresini
Leonard A Obohoski

cc



190t7PW Gasoline, Heating Oil, Diesel'Fuel 3/27 l2or8

Quantity Base Delivery Discount Price Total Math Total Bid Variance

Sasoline SmallTank
Gasoline Tank

20000 St.67zs so.1619 s1.8344 S36,688.00 s36,688.00 so.oo

325000 S1.672s 5o.o26s S1.6990 S5s2,17s.oo ss52,175.00 so.oo

Heating Oil SmallTank, ULS s0000 s1.8470 s0.1619 s2.oo89 S1oo,44s.oo S1oo,445.oo s0.00

Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 55000 S1.8470 s0.0339 s1.8809 S103,449.s0 s94,04s.00 s9,404.s0

Diesel Fuel SmallTank, ULSD 25000 s1.9165 s0.2170 S2.133s 5s3,337.50 ss3,337.s0 50.00

Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD 165000 s 1.916s So.o445 S 1.9610 s323,s6s.00 s323,56s.00 50.00

Grand Total S1,169,oGo.oo

Mansfield Oil

Gasoline SmallTank 20000 5L.6725 5t.672s s33,4s0.00 NO BID #VALUE!

Gasoline Large Tank 325000 5r.672s s0.0663 s1.7388 s565,110.00 ss65,110.00 So.oo

Heating Oil SmallTank, UL5 50000 S1.8470 s1.8470 s92,3s0.00 NO BID #VALUEI

Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 55000 s1.8470 s0.0707 s]',9L77 $10s,473.s0 s10s,473.50 50.00

Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 s1.916s s1.916s 547,9!2.50 NO BID #VAIUE!

Diesel Fuel Laree Tank, ULSD 165000 s1.9165 So.0731 s1.98e6 s328,284,00 S32B,284.oo so.o0

Grand Total S1,172,580.00

Petroleum Traders

Gasoline SmallTank 20000 5r.6725 5t.672s S33,450.00 NO BID #VALUEI

Gasoline Large Tank 325000 sI.672s so.03s6 st.7rzt sss6,432.s0 S5s6,432.50 So.oo

Heating Oil Small Tank, ULS s0000 s1.8470 St.g+zo s92,3s0,00 NO BID #VALUEI

Heatins Oil Large Tahk, ULS s5000 S1.8470 s0.0479 ;1.8949 S104,219,50 s94,745.00 5e,474.s0

Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 S1.916s ;1.9165 547,gtz.so NO BID. #VALUEI

Diesel Fuel LarRe Tank, ULSD 165000 s1.916s so.os80 S1.974s
'5325,792.5o s32s.792.s0 5o.oo

Grand Total $x,1so,l5z.oo

lnc.

Sasoline Small Tank

Gasolirie La Tank

*Note on Proposal'Form - Generator Delivery fee is Sl

20000 5t.6725 s0.32s0 i1.9975 s39,9s0.00 S39,9so.oo So.oo

325000 St.672s s0.0424 S1.7149 s557,342.s0 sss7,349.oo -$6.s0

Heatins Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 s1.8470 50.2399 s2.0869 S104,34s.oo s104,345.00 so.o0

Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 55000 51.8470 s0.0608 s1.9078 s104,929.00 5104,929.22 -s0.22

Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 S1.916s So.grco s2.230s sss,762.50 S5s.762.50 So.oo

Diesel Fuel Large Tank, UISD 165000 s1.9155 $o.o+gs $1.9660 s324,3s0.00 5324,395.94 -5s.ga

Grand Total $1,186,719.00

Jamel River'Solutlons

Gasoline Small Tank 20000 st.672s 5o.20oo s1.8725 s37,4s0,00 S37,450,00 s0.00

Gasoline Large Tank 325000 S 1.672s So.oSso sL.707S Sss4,937.50 Sss4,937.50 so.oo

Heating Oil Small Ta.nk, ULS s0000 s1.8470 s0.2000 Sz.o47o S1o2,3so.oo S1o2,3so.oo $o.oo

Heatins Oil Large Tank, ULS -55000 s1.8470 So.oqro $1.8880 S103,84o.oo S94,4oo.oo S9,44o.oo

Diesel Fuel Small Tank, UL5D 25000 s1.9165 So.2ooo s2.1165 ss2,912.s0 S52,912.s0 5o.oo

Diesel Fuel Large Tank, UL5D 165000 S1.s16s so.o620 s1.978s s326,4s2.50 S326,4s2.50 So.oo

Grand Total 5L,t77,942,s0

Superior Plus Energy

Gasoline Small Tank 20000 5r.672s So.397s S2.07oo 541,400.00 S41,4oo.oo So.oo

Gasoline Large Tank 325000 5r.612s So.097s 5'J..770o 557s,250.00 S57s,2so.oo so.oo

Heatins Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 s 1.8470 50.397s 52.244s S112,22s.00 5112,22s.O0 5o.oo

Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 55000

25000
S1.8470 s0.097s S1.944s 5106,947.s0 s106,947.s0 so.o0

Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD s1.9165 So.:gzs s2.3140 Ss7,8so.oo Ss7,85o.oo So.oo

Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD s 1.9165 s0.097s $z.otqo a.ta ..^ 
^^)JJZ,JIV,VU

41ar .4 
^ ^^)JJ4,JAV.UV

Grand Total SL,zzs,9B2.so



CERTIFICATE OF AWARD OF CONTRACT

I hereby certi$' that Contract No. 19017PW is on this.l6th of 4pril2Q1& awarded to Riggins, Inc in the

amountof $1.169,660.00asperProposal dated3/26/2018 andthatthisawardismadeincompliancewith
\X/ilm. Code (Charter), Section 8-200, to wit:

Plans and specifications for tl're work, supplies, or materials wete filed with the Department of
Finance,Division of ProcurementandRecords forpublicinspection on3/6/18 &3/1i/18.

2. The advertisement calling for sealed bids on this contract was published in the News Journal on

3 / 6 / 18 & 3 / 13 / 78 stated that bids would be opened at 3:00 p.m. on 3 / 27 / 2018

L

3. All sealed bids received were publicly opened in the office of the Department of Finance,

Division of Procr.uement and Records in the ptesence of the City Auditor desiring to make the

purchase at 3:00 p.tn . on 3/27 /2018. Other persons present at the opening of the bids wete:

Philip Ceresini. YvetteJohnson, Tina Austin

4. Bids vrere submitted by the following contrabtors in the following amounts:

Contractor
fuggins, Inc.
Mansfield
Petroleum Traders
PAPCO,Inc

James fuver Solutions
Superior Plus Energy

Addtess
Vineland, NJ
Gainesville, GA
Fort lVayne, In
Aston, PA
Ashland, VA
Rochester, NY

Date of Bid
3/27 /18
3/27 /18
3/27 /18
3/27 /rB
3/27 /18
3/27 /18

Amount
$1,169;66o.oo

$1,172,580.00*
$1,160,157.00*
$1,186,719.00

fi1,,777,942.50
fiL,225,982.50

*Did not bid all items

5. Ciry License Number

6. Upon recommendation of Cornmissioner of Public Works and after due consideration, I
determined that the contractor to whom this avzatd is made was the Iowest responsible bidder. In support of
this deterrnination I have received the following written recommendations, which are on file at my office:

Author Emolovrnent Position Date

Kelly Williams Commissioner of Public Works 3/28/2018

Departrnent of Finance, Division of Procurement



I

Riggins.-lLq-

COPY OF RTSOI,

I, the undersigned, Secretary of Riggins, lpc.

RESOLVED, that the President, _

a.

NJ corporation, hereby certify that the followingResolutions
excerpted from the Minutes of the Corporation w-ere {uly adopted by 

'nanimeus consent of the
Board of Directors of the corporation, on the Ao:!_day of _April _201_g

nd
secretary/ treagllgl*_ _, of this Corporation be and he hereby is

authorized to execute and deliver on behalf of this corporation a conhact -and other contract
documents by and between this Qeryelation and the City of Wilmiqgts4 Delaware, Deparhentof Finance, J.8023W. Gasoline/ Heating Oil and Diesel Fuel S for the Conbact price of

is authorized to attest

I firther certiff tbat the foregoing.Resolutions have not been rescinded or moclified and
remain in full force ad effect.

I firrther certify that the following are the names of all officers qualified to lign for the
Corporation:

$J t tt q beo. 06 [ and

FURTHER RESOLVED,

President:

Vice President

Treasurer:

Secretary

Assistant Secretary

that the Secretary of this Corporation be and fFrE
to the said conhact aud otler documents.

tns

Richard E Cummines, Jr and Steven D Riggins

lngllg* Rissins

Matthew Riggins

nla

R. .leq!

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, Ihave hereunto set my hand and the seal of the Corporationthis- ?Oh_aayof-nprit Z0_ts AD.



I. the Treasurer of lhe State of New Jersey, do hereby certifv that the
a b o v e- n a ry 9 d N ew J_qrs ey D an e s ti 9 F o 1'! yqfi t- C o ryi o rati ti n w a s
registered by this ofricebn Decentber 13, 1957.

As of the date of this certificate, said business contirtues os an acttve
business irt godd standing in the State of New Jersey, and its Annual
Reports are current.

I further certify that the registered agent and ffice are:

STATE OF NEW JERSEY
DEPARTMENT OF THE TREASURY

DIWSION OF REVENUE AND ENTERPRISE SERVICES
SHORT FORM STANDING

RIGGINS,INC.
5499410000

JAMES J GRUCCIO ESQ
817 E. LANDIS AYE.
VINEI}IND, NJ 08361

IN TESTIMONY I'I.HEREOF, I lwve
hereunto set nU' hand and at/ixed
nq, Onicial Seal ol Trenton, this.
lOth dq,of Ma1,,2017

pfrb6ln4
Ford 14. Sadder
Acting Stote Treasurer

Certllicate liulrher : 607963 l75l

Ilcrift this ccntficatc onlinc a!

h t tps :lhnrx I s t u r & n!. Lt ITYT R 
-S 

I a ndi n gCcn,ASP./ f erifi'-C rrt irrl-

f-
tc
Eo



(
CONTRACT-----

THIS AGREEMENT, made the 2Otn day of Apri I t the year Two Thousand

Eighteen and between the City of \X/ilmington, a municipal corporation of the State of Delaware,

acting through the agency of the.Department of Finance, Division of Procurement and Records,

party of the first part (hereinafter designated the Ownet), and Riggins Inc., party of the second

part (hereinafter designated the Contractors)

WITNESSETH, that the Contractot, in consideration of agreements herein made by the

Owner, agrees with the Ownet as follows:

Article 1. The Contractor shall and witl furnish and deliver per specifications, on contract

19017PW "Gasoline/Heating Oil/Diesel Fuel" for the Department of Public Works in

accordance with Advertisement fot Bids by the Department of Finance, Division of Procurement

and Records date 3/6/2015 & 3/13/18 and specifications identified as Contract No. 19017PW and

by the signatures of the p'aties hereto, are, togethet with the said Advertisement for Bids,

Instructions to Bidders, Forms of Ptoposal , and/ ot other documents pertinent thereto, hereby

acknowledge and incolporated into these presents and are to be taken 
^s ^ 

p^rtof this Contract.

Atticle 2. It is understood and agteed by and between the parties hereto that the amount of

this Contract is in the amount of,O+e Million One Hyndr

Hundred Sixw -00/100($1,169,660.00) as per Proposal dated 3/26/2018 to the Department of

Finance, Division of Procurement and Records.

Article 3. In the petformance of this Contract, the Contractor shall not discriminate or

permit discrimination against any person because of his race, color, religion or his national origin.

Article 4. This Agreement shall bind the heirs, executo.rs, administrators, successors and

assigns to the respective parties hereto.



{ In witness whereof the party of the fust part has, by recommendation of the Commissionef of

Public Works, caused the hand of Michael S. Purzycki, Mayor, and the co{porate seal of the City

of Wilmington, attested by the City Clerk, to be hereunto affixed; and the party of the second part

has caused the hand of its' President, (or his authorized representative) and its' colporate seal,

attested by the Secretary or assistant Secretary, to be hereunto affixed.

Dated the day and year frst above written in the City of Wilmington, Counry of New Castle, State

of Delaware.

$igped, Sealed and delivered
rn the ptesence ot:

THE CITY OF WILMINGTON

Witness Michael S. Putzycla,

ATTEST:

City Clerk

Riggins,Inc.

8S

Pres

ATTEST:

Byt


